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The issue of food security has in recent times attracted a lot of scholarly 
debates in Nigeria. In spite of different methodologies utilised by the 
governments in addressing the challenge, the issue still persists. Results 
further revealed that the agricultural sector has not performed palatably in its 
quest for ensuring sustainable development. Suffice to note that agriculture 
should be given its rightful place if the country wants to experience 
development that will be said to be sustainable. In addressing this, the second 
Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs) become handy because of its 
emphasis on eradicating hunger, which can only be achieved when the role of 
agriculture is recognised in the nation. It is on this premise that this paper 
examined the key role of Agriculture in achieving Sustainable Development 
Goal 2 in Nigeria. This is a conceptual paper that relies on an extensive review 
of related literature. The findings show that the agriculture sector faces many 
challenges, making it quite difficult in achieving its main goal which is 
ensuring an adequate supply of food in all parts of the country. In specific 
terms, the current insurgency in Northern Nigeria has been one of the major 
factors which have further destabilised the lopsided agricultural sector in the 
country. The paper recommended among others that investment in the 
agricultural sector should be given top priority by the Federal, State and Local 
Governments so that the continuous dependence on imported products will be 
reduced, as well as to relieve dependence on the oil sector for economic 
growth. 
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